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Mari Swa: Hello, my friends! Thank you for being here with me again. I hope you are
happy and well today. I send you all a big hug. I am Mari. This information can be
seen as science fiction or as the viewer sees best and I post it for entertainment
purposes only. Still, I take my information very seriously and for whoever has eyes to
see.

For those of you who are new here, Arishah, or Ari in short, is a 300 kilogram, over
three meter tall Urmah orange tiger, who is one of the communications officers on
board the starship Avyon One, currently in low Earth orbit. This is the second video
where I interview Ari, the second part of many, as you have sent me countless
interesting questions, and I will be sharing Ari's answers with you for several videos to
come shortly. However, I must place a few other subjects between them to avoid
monotony.

I must state that the translation, or processing from the language I use to
communicate with Ari, is mine, therefore you may notice the same wording I use, but I
do my best to keep Ari's concepts as clear and direct as possible. With not much ado,
let's go back to the questions.

Mari Swa: Ari, are there any spiritual or technological concepts that are widely used
and accepted by other empathic positive races with which your race may not agree?

Arishah: When there is enough data about spiritual and technological concepts, that
points out that they are either real or are the best model we can work to get closer to
the truth. We study them all from our Urmah point of view and then decide if they
serve us or not. If a group of concepts is widely accepted as correct or real, it doesn't
necessarily mean they are so. Yet, I can say that we mostly agree with the spiritual
and scientific concepts and ideas used by most interstellar positive races.

However, there are some concepts that are widely accepted and that we do not agree
with. One of the most important concepts we strongly disagree with is the one I have
already exposed with you in past interviews, and it has to do with the
service-to-others mentality. In a hypothetical perfect society, ideally if all its members
are in a service-to-others mentality, the needs of the one are met and satisfied by the
service received from the rest. The problem is that we do not live in perfect societies,
not on Earth and not anywhere else, therefore having a pure service-to-others
mentality ends up opening doors for abuse.

Many positive races which observe and impose the service-to-others mentality on
their citizens, such as the Andromedans or the Arcturians, even condemn any
service-to-self activity, or even thoughts of their people, claiming that it leads to
becoming regressive, claiming that it leads to the dark side. This also means that all
other spiritual practices end up being adopted and obeyed by their citizens, as they
do not dare question what their establishment has accepted as correct, ethical and
real. This causes everyone to think the same, even more as they end up following
appointed spiritual leaders who only repeat what others imposed on them as well.

We do not agree with this mentality and even less with that being imposed on their



citizens, as it leads to developing strong feelings of inadequacy and even guilt, simply
because one or another of their members wants to fulfill their own path while being
alive, as if they did not have the right to exist as individuals. Therefore, we strongly
believe that imposing service-to-others in an Andromedan compulsory way only
hinders the spiritual growth and progression of its members. I may even go as far as
to claim that it smells like spiritual "communism", as that description will be easily
understood by our friends and listeners on Earth. 

As we, the Urmah people, have come to understand, the way we have chosen to
think is that we teach our cubs to follow their interests and pursue their personal
development since they are very young. And while we are at it, we teach them how
we are all inter-connected, and that we are all One, and why.

The Urmah people believe that we can only help others from a place of strength, so
we first concentrate on developing ourselves in every way, especially spiritually, and
only then do we share ourselves with others, and only to a degree where we are not
hurting ourselves. Service-to-others does run strong with the Urmah, it is what
characterizes us as people and as a society, but only when we can share the fruits of
our strengths, and of our accomplished individuality and strong ego.

Other empathic positive races have a hard time understanding the Urmah way of
thinking, many accusing us of being egocentric, when in fact the result of this feline
mentality is a much stronger society and culture, where individuality is celebrated, as
it strongly nourishes all its members; us all. In our society, no Urmah is in real need,
as we are all there to give a helping hand to friends and family, feline or not, and we
can help because we are always in a place of strength. Because we are the Urmah,
and that says it all.

Mari Swa: Next question: You have said that we must not trust the Etorthans,
understandably so, but what do you have to say about the Alpha Dracos, especially
about the ones in Earth's orbit now? Why should we trust them to be as positive as
they say they are? 

Before you answer this question, let me remind my viewers that Alpha Dracos are
full-blown interstellar dragons, which may be 15 meters tall, or more. They are several
tons of fire-spitting lizards, and the head of a full-grown male can be as big as a
Volkswagen Beetle.

Arishah: The mentality of the Alpha Draconians is very different from the Etorthan
one. The Alpha Dracos as a species have always been characterized by a strong
duality. They have always been either very negative or very positive since time
immemorial. Alpha Draconians are not a unified one-government culture in species.
Although they may be genetically the same, they do not think the same, as some of
their cultures have been based on exploitation, destruction and terrorizing other
people, while other Alpha Draco cultures have been characterized by being helpful
and protectors of other species, especially when they are in need or under the attack
of regressive invasive races, which may also include regressive Alpha Draconians.

The regressive Alpha Draconians have been kept at bay and under control and their
invasive expansion has been prevented and stopped by the action of only two races:
the positive Alpha Dracos and us, the Urmah. We have fought many battles against
the regressive Alpha Draconians and their main minions, the smaller regressive
Draconians, side by side with the positive dragons, and we have shed blood together.



The very ultra-powerful superb Galactic Federation on its own cannot stop the
regressive Alpha Draconian Commonwealth, which is also part of the Orion Council. 

The positive Alpha Dracos have proven to be so for ages; they have cooperated with
the Urmah people in the eradication of their regressive counterparts many times.
They are big powerful lizards, but they know the meaning of honor and the value of
their word. They are also part of the Orion Council, but they have proven many times
to be one of the most important agents that prevent and stop the expansion of all
kinds of regressive and invasive races, especially of those within the Orion Council
itself.

Furthermore, the Alpha Dracos, although of reptilian lineage, are empathic and highly
emotional as a race, and this emotional factor is also why we can explain their being
positive. Unlike the Etorthans, the positive Alpha Draco have proven to be honorable
people and we have good diplomatic relationships with them, based on mutual
respect.

Mari Swa: Thank you, Ari! Next question: Can an Etorthan and their strong telepathy
invade an Urmah mind?

Arishah: When Etorthans want to invade a mind, to control it they first may attempt to
impose concepts directly and invasively, and if their victim is strong, they will then
impose ideas making the subject believe it's their own thoughts. They tend to impose
elaborate thought-patterns on their victims, as if they were theirs, all to lead their
minds to think that they have arrived at conclusions following their own logic.

This is a highly unethical and manipulative strategy, but for it to work, the victim must
have doubts of their own, weak points in their own personality, and in their frame of
ideas, values and ethics. The victim must first doubt its capacity to decide and to see
right from wrong. The Etorthans exploit those holes in their victim's personality; holes
that exist because of the victim's lack of a healthy personal frame, strong doubts in
their capacity to make decisions, and to discern ethics and self- knowledge.

The Urmah have a very strong personal frame, and our ethics and values are well
established and solid. The Etorthans are very dangerous because they mentally
exploit the weaknesses of their victim's mind, but Urmah are strong everywhere,
especially in the mind. We do not become over-confident when dealing with
Etorthans, but I would say that invading an Urmah-mind would be their most difficult
challenge, and I doubt they can do so. And that is why we know them for who they
are, because they cannot brainwash us with their supposed positive agenda and
pro-Orion propaganda. This is yet another example of why it is so important to grow a
strong ethical/spiritual frame and ego, and only share what you can from that place of
power.

Mari Swa: Thank you, Ari!

The Ari interview will continue shortly. I cannot make this one longer, or I will not be
able to publish it for tomorrow. There is a lot more about Ari to share with you.

Thank you for watching my video and for liking, sharing and subscribing! I appreciate
it a lot, and I hope to see you here next time. Take care!

With much love.



Your friend,

Mari Swaruu


